
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

S T A T U T O R Y  I N S T R U M E N T S

2014 No. 878 (L. 21)

TRIBUNALS AND INQUIRIES,
ENGLAND AND WALES

The Upper Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum
Chamber) (Judicial Review) (England and

Wales) Fees (Amendment) Order 2014

Made       -      -      -      - 27th March 2014

Laid before Parliament 1st April 2014

Coming into force       -      - 22nd April 2014

The Lord Chancellor makes the following Order in exercise of the powers conferred by section 42
of the Tribunals, Courts and Enforcement Act 2007(1), with the consent of the Treasury and having
consulted in accordance with section 42(5) of that Act.

Citation and commencement

1. This Order may be cited as the Upper Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum Chamber) (Judicial
Review) (England and Wales) Fees (Amendment) Order 2014 and comes into force on 22nd April
2014.

Amendment to the Upper Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum Chamber) (Judicial Review)
(England and Wales) Fees Order 2011

2.  (1)  The Upper Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum Chamber) (Judicial Review) (England and
Wales) Fees Order 2011(2) is amended as follows.

(2)  In the table in Schedule 1 (fees to be take in immigration judicial review proceedings)—
(a) at fee 1.1 in the right hand column, for “£60” substitute “£140”;
(b) at fee 1.1(a) in the right hand column, for “£215” substitute “£350”;
(c) in the note to fee 1.1(a) for “fee 1.2 is not payable.” substitute “the amount payable under

fee 1.2 is £350.”;
(d) at fee 1.2 in the right hand column, for “£215” substitute “£700”;

(1) 2007 c. 15.
(2) S.I. 2011/2344. Schedule 1 has been amended by S.I. 2013/2069 and 2013/2302.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2007/15
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/2344
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2069
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2302


Document Generated: 2014-04-01
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

2

(e) at fee 1.3 in the right hand column, for “£60” substitute “£140”.

Signed by the authority of the Lord Chancellor

27th March 2014

Shailesh Vara
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State

Ministry of Justice

We consent

27th March 2014

Sam Gyimah
Anne Milton

Two of the Lords Commissioners of Her
Majesty’s Treasury



Document Generated: 2014-04-01
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

3

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Order)

This Order amends the Upper Tribunal (Immigration and Asylum Chamber) (Judicial Review)
(England and Wales) Fees Order 2011 (S.I. 2011/2344).
It increases the fees payable on starting judicial review proceedings in the Upper Tribunal.
If the fee has been paid for a request to reconsider at a hearing a decision on permission to bring a
judicial review and permission is subsequently granted at a hearing, only half of the judicial review
fee is then payable.
A full impact assessment of the effects of these fee increases can be found at https://
consult.justice.gov.uk/digital-communications/court-fees-proposals-for-reform.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/2344
https://consult.justice.gov.uk/digital-communications/court-fees-proposals-for-reform
https://consult.justice.gov.uk/digital-communications/court-fees-proposals-for-reform

