
 

S T A T U T O R Y  I N S T R U M E N T S  

2015 No. 1429 

EDUCATION, ENGLAND 

The Diocese of Ely (Educational Endowments) (Shouldham 

Church of England School) (Amendment) Order 2015 

Made - - - - 23rd June 2015 

Coming into force - - 13th July 2015 

The Secretary of State for Education, in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 554 and 556 

of the Education Act 1996(a) hereby makes the following Order— 

Citation and commencement 

1. This Order may be cited as the Diocese of Ely (Educational Endowments) (Shouldham 

Church of England School) (Amendment) Order 2015 and shall come into force on 13th July 

2015. 

Amendment to the Diocese of Ely (Educational Endowments) (Shouldham Church of 

England School) Order 2015 

2.—(1) The Diocese of Ely (Educational Endowments) (Shouldham Church of England School) 

Order 2015(b) is amended as follows: 

(2) In paragraph (2) to the preamble for “£139,011.73” substitute “£123,935.33”. 

(3) In article 2 for “£139,011.73” substitute “£123,935.33”. 

 

 

 

Signed by the authority of the Secretary of State 

 

 Sally Wiseman 

 Deputy Director 

23rd June 2015 Department for Education 

 

 

 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Order) 

This Order amends the Diocese of Ely (Educational Endowments) (Shouldham Church of England 

School) Order 2015 (“the principal Order”). The principal Order makes new provision as to the 

use of the endowment of the foundation known as Shouldham Church of England School. 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) 1996 c.56. 
(b) 2015/832. 



 2

This Order amends paragraph (2) to the recitals of the principal Order and amends article 2 of the 

principal Order both of which incorrectly state the value of the assets representing the endowment 

of the foundation as £137,011.73. This Order substitutes the correct figure of £123,935.33. 


