Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2014 No. 296
MARRIAGE

The Marriage (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2014

Made - - - - 4 December 2014
Coming into operation 2 March 2015

The Department of Finance and Personnel in exercise of the powers conferred on it by Articles 3(3),
8(4), 21(4) and 39(2) of the Marriage (Northern Ireland) Order 2003(1) hereby makes the following
Regulations.

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Marriage (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland)
2014 and shall come into operation on 2 March 2015.

Amendments to the Marriage Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2003

2. (1) The Marriage Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2003(2) shall be amended as follows.
(2) In Regulation 3(2) for “14 days” (in each place where it occurs), substitute “28 days”.
(3) In Regulation 7(2) for “14 days”, substitute “28 days”.

(4) In Regulation 27(b) for “14 days”, substitute “28 days”.

(5) In Schedule 1 for “14 days”, substitute “28 days”.

(6) In Schedule 7 for “14 days”, substitute “28 days”.

(1) S.1.2003/413 (N.L 3)
(2) S.R.2003 No. 468


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/2003/413
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2003/468

Document Generated: 2014-12-10
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Finance and Personnel on 4 December 2014.

T'N Caven
A senior officer of the
Department of Finance and Personnel



Document Generated: 2014-12-10
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations amend the Marriage Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2003 (S.R. 2003 No. 468) to
increase the time limit for service of the marriage notice on the registrar from at least 14 days before
the date of the intended marriage to at least 28 days before the date of the intended marriage. For
consistency, a similar amendment is made to the time limit for issue by the registrar of a certificate
in respect of legal capacity to marry and a consequential amendment is made to the time limit for
payment of fees in respect of attendance of the registrar.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2003/468

